
Established in 1997, as a full service DMC (Destination Management Company) and a subsidiary of
Liberty International Tourism Group, we use our extensive expertise to design a wide range of wildlife
and specialist safaris, unique cultural experiences, adventure activities and beach breaks across East
Africa. We are meticulous about customer service and pride ourselves on our genuinely sustainable ethos.

Safari Experience

Day 1 Nairobi

On arrival at Nairobi’s Jomo Kenyatta International Airport, go through the Customs and Immigration
procedures. After clearing customs and immigration formalities, you will be met by a Liberty Africa
Safaris representative and transferred to your Nairobi Hotel. 

This 45-suite boutique hotel elevates the standard of luxury for travelers in the region. Beautiful in its
symmetry and flooded with natural light, this plantation-style property is airy and spacious. Each of our
80m² suites have a private balcony overlooking the iconic silhouette of the Ngong Hills, a magical view
which can also be enjoyed over sundowners at the Bar.

Dinner and overnight at Hemingway’s Hotel Nairobi BB (Drinks Included)

Day 2 Masai Mara

After breakfast transfer to Wilson airport for your scheduled flight to the Masai Mara National Reserve
departing at 10:30hrs arriving at 11:10hrs. Met on arrival at the airstrip by your camp driver guide and
transfer to your camp. Lunch at the camp. After noon on activities that the camp has to offer. 

Experience unspoiled eastern Africa up close and personal at the “Instinct of the Mara” lodge. Hidden
away in a corner of Olderkesi Conservancy the camp celebrates the true luxury of privacy and endless
possibilities. Here, the magical “Out of Africa” feeling is ever-present. Embedded in the untouched
nature of the 7,600-acre conservancy in the secluded southeast of the Maasai Mara, you enjoy
unforgettable safaris in one of the most beautiful and animal-rich areas of Kenya. On game drives you
will encounter antelope, buffalo, zebra, wildebeest, giraffe, elephant, rhino, lion, leopard, and cheetah. 

Dinner and overnight at Instinct of the Mara LDBB (Drinks Included)

Day 3 and 4 Masai Mara

Day spent game-viewing in the reserve. With morning and afternoon game drives, you have ample time
to discover all that this globally famous wilderness has to offer. A pristine wilderness of haunting beauty,
it promises its visitors a profusion of wildlife, prolific bird life and the unprecedented opportunity of
catching up with all the members of the 'Big Five' in one morning! 

All meals and overnight at Instinct of the Mara LDBB (Drinks Included)
         
Day 5 Masai Mara - Tsavo West

After breakfast, you will be transferred to the local airstrip for your flight to Tsavo West National Park
(Mombasa Air departing at 11:30hrs arriving at 12:30hrs). You will be met upon arrival by your camp
driver guide and transfer to Kipalo in time for lunch. Afternoon on activities offered by the camp.

The place you return to again and again “. This is what Kipalo means in the language of the Taitas, the
tribe living in the region. No wonder – the view from the slopes of the Mbulia Hills over the vast plains of
Tsavo and the Ngulia Hills to the majestic Mt. Kilimanjaro is sim- ply breathtaking and awakens a feeling
of infinite freedom. If you are looking for seclusion, privacy and unforgettable encounters with Kenya ‘s
unique wildlife, then Kipalo Hills is the place for you. The camp, which nestles perfectly against the rocky
hillside, was established on the grounds of the Mbulia Group Ranch, which covers almost 36,000 acres,
on the initiative of the local people. 

Dinner and overnight at Kipalo Hills LDBB (Drinks Included) 

Day 6 and 7 Tsavo West

Day spent exploring Tsavo West National Park which achieved notoriety in the 1900’s when ‘the Man-
eaters of Tsavo’, a pair of rogue man-eating lions, preyed gruesomely on the builders of the Uganda
Railway. Today the Park is more famous for the numerous prides of mane-less lion that patrol the plains
and police the herbivore herd. Other wildlife highlights – vast herds of dust-red elephant, fat pods of
hippo, giant crocodile, teeming herds of plains game, a fantasia of bird life and some magical flora. 

All meals and overnight at Kipalo Hills LDBB (Drinks Included)

Day 8 Mombasa North

After breakfast, transfer by road to Voi for a train ride to Mombasa (Mariakani Station) where you will
be met by a Liberty representative and transferred to your hotel on the North Coast, a paradise of sand
and bright blue sea. The Kenyan coast offers a colorful history. From the 9th century onwards, Indian, and
Arab traders mingled with the indigenous population to create the unique Swahili culture, much of which
still survives until this day. The remains of many early Swahili settlements dot the coastline, the most
significant being the 15th century Gedi ruins south of Malindi, while Lamu town has been designated a
World Heritage Site due to its significance as a Swahili Centre. The coast also boasts unique and diverse
habitats, both in maritime and terrestrial national parks and reserves. Highlights include Mombasa Old
Town, Lamu, Gedi among others. 

Lunch, Dinner and overnight at Cardamom House LDBB (Drinks Included)

Day 9 & 10 Mombasa North
Days spent at your leisure.

On a wild piece of land fringed by sea and dense vegetation, there was once an old, picturesque house
that has been conjured into a refined accommodation in minimalist Swahili style. Created by a Swahili
architect to celebrate the beauty of the land and sea, the property has been carefully woven around
existing trees and delights with unobstruc- ted sea views.

The décor reflects the nature of the surroundings, ancient Swahili textures and shapes. Mixed with
modern Afro-chic design and hearty service, guests experience here barefoot luxury at its best. The
entire complex faces the glistening turquoise waters of the Indian Ocean, whose colours are reflected in
the lovingly selected decorative elements.

All meals and overnight at Cardamom House LDBB (Drinks Included)

Day 11 Nairobi

After breakfast, you will be transferred to the local airstrip in time for your flight to Nairobi departing at
13:15hrs arriving at 14:30hrs. You will be met upon arrival by a Liberty Representative and will be
transferred to Four Points Nairobi Airport for lunch and check in for your Day Room and later to Jomo
Kenyata International Airport for your international Flight.
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